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CROSS STEER® FOR 1933-1934 FORDS 

# 8000680 

Full refund will NOT be granted to any kits that are 
damaged, scratched, or altered in any fashion.

BBEEFFOORREE  YYOOUU  BBEEGGIINN::  

OOuurr  rraacckk  aanndd  ppiinniioonn  kkiitt  iiss  ddeessiiggnneedd  ttoo  rreeppllaaccee  ttrraaddiittiioonnaall  ccrroossss  sstteeeerriinngg  tthhaatt  

uuttiilliizzeess  oorriiggiinnaall,,  oorr  aafftteerrmmaarrkkeett  sstteeeerriinngg  bbooxxeess  ((ssuucchh  aass  VVeeggaa))..  TThhiiss  uunniitt  iiss  

ssppeecciiffiiccaallllyy  ddeessiiggnneedd  ffoorr  11993333--11993344  ssttyyllee  FFoorrddss  oonnllyy..  FFrraammeess  tthhaatt  hhaavvee  bbeeeenn  

mmooddiiffiieedd  oorr  aapppplliiccaattiioonnss  tthhaatt  wwee  hhaavvee  nnoott  ccaattaallooggeedd  mmuusstt  bbee  mmeeaassuurreedd  ttoo  aassssuurree  

pprrooppeerr  ffiitt  aanndd  ffuunnccttiioonn..  

DDUUEE  TTOO  VVAARRIIAABBLLEESS  OOUUTTSSIIDDEE  OOUURR  CCOONNTTRROOLL  TTHHEESSEE  KKIITTSS  MMAAYY  NNOOTT  FFIITT  

AALLLL  AAPPPPLLIICCAATTIIOONNSS..  AALLSSOO,,  PPLLEEAASSEE  VVEERRIIFFYY  KKIITT  WWIILLLL  FFIITT  YYOOUURR  

AAPPPPLLIICCAATTIIOONN  BBEEFFOORREE  AALLTTEERRIINNGG  VVEEHHIICCLLEE..  

Kit Contents: 

# Part Number Description Quantity 

1 8000480 Cross Steer Rack 1 

2 8020590 Cross Steer Bracket 1 

3 240510 Tie Rod End Tube 1 

4 230540 5/16”-18 x 3 Buttonhead Stainless Screw 3 

5 230550 5/16”-18 x ½ Buttonhead Stainless Screw 2 

6 120400 11/16 Right Jam Nut 1 

7 620220 Mounting Kit 1 

https://www.carid.com/unisteer/
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1. EXAMINE YOUR EXISTING STEERING

Before starting the rack and pinion installation, examine your existing steering, to assure that your 
suspension was correct to begin with. Figure A and C show the drag link rods in their proper 
location. Note that each is parallel to the axle and to each other, and each is equal height from 
the ground. If these bars are not as pictured, steps should be taken to position the new mounting 
bracket so that they are as pictured. 

The mounting bracket was developed using several chassis manufacturers specifications, this 
does not mean that there aren’t slight differences from one to the other. The bracket in our 
standard kit is made with a 96 degree angle between the frame and the axle. You should verify 
this dimension before installing the bracket (see figure B). This kit is designed to replace Vega 
steering boxes with a 6” straight pitman arm.   
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2. REMOVE EXISTING STEERING

Before removing any components position the cars front wheels and steering wheel in the straight 
ahead position. Secure the wheel so it does not move (tying a rope to the wheel and fastening it 
to a stationary object). Measure the distance between the inside of the front wheel (back of the 
rim, half up from the ground) to the frame on both sides of the front end. Use these 
measurements as a reference, as to the wheels being straight. Remove right side outer tie end 
(use a puller). Unbolt steering box, and remove it and the tie rod tube. Remove the old tie rod 
ends from your tie rod tube and the pitman arm. Determine which of these has left hand thread 
and use it with the new rack. (Unless replacing)   

3. RACK AND PINION INSTALLATION

The rack and pinion will be in its center position when it is purchased. A paint mark indicates this 
position; you can verify the center position by measuring the rack from the rail side of the bracket 
to end of the left side rack bellow. This dimension be should be 2.125”.  Bolt rack and bracket 
back in the same spot the old steering box was, or position the bracket in the desired location and 
attach to the rail by welding or bolting. Screw the outer tie rod and jam nut in the tie rod tube until 
it stops. Equally adjust the tie rod tube so that there is the same amount of threads showing on 
both the inner and outer end, and the outer end stud is in line with the steering-arm hole.  
Remember there is an inner end (ball joint) under the rubber boot, this is will travel, it is stiff 
because the unit is brand new.  Insert the outer tie rod in the steering arm and torque castle nut to 
normal specifications. 

Check toe measurement taken earlier. If measurement is different adjust tie rod tube until it is the 
same as earlier. Locktite and tighten both jam nuts. 

UNISTEER Performance Products® 

No part of these materials can be reproduced or utilized in any form or by any 

means, electronic or mechanical, including photocopying, recording or by any information 

storage and retrieval system, with permission in writing from Maval Manufacturing 

Corporation.
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