
1.The filter is located
under the hood.  Open 
the hood, locate the  
plastic cowl on the  
passenger side and 
unlock the 4 retaining 
bolts by turning them 
counter clockwise. 

2. Remove the upper
shroud cover to reveal 
the filter housing.  
Unlock the 3 filter  
housing retaining bolts 
by turning them counter 
clockwise.   

3. Disconnect the sensor
harness by depressing 
clip then pulling away. 

4. Remove filter housing
by lifting and pulling 
away.  Turn housing over 
to reveal the 2 filters.   
Remove the filter by  
depressing the 4 retaining 
clips per filter.  Lift the 
filter up and pull away 
from the housing.  Repeat 
for the other filter. 

5. Install the new TYC
filters by pushing the  
filter down into the  
housing.  Ensure the filter 
housing clips are fully  
engaged and locked. 

6. Reinstall in reverse
order.  

07-10 BMW X5 
08-10 BMW X6  

Replacement for OEM 
64 31 6 945 586 

TYC #: 800116C2 Estimated Time : 10 min. 

Installation guide pictures are from the BOLD vehicle model. 

Looking for replacement A/C and heating parts? Visit our website.

https://www.carid.com/air-conditioning-heating-parts.html
https://www.carid.com/tyc/

