
1234-56789

1234-56789

1234-56789

123456

Installation 
Instructions

1  Place the label with the door lock 
replacement key code onto the inside 
of your vehicle’s glove compartment. or by 
completing the remaining portion of the 
form and return-ing it to McGard in the 
envelope provided. This service is FREE. 
Registration will assist you if you ever 
need to order a replacement key.

2   On the upper door hinge, hang/place 
paint protector centered just below the 
hinge nut. For some YJ models use 
painters tape to hold in place.

3  Using the appropriate driver, socket, or 
bit, remove the hinge nut.  

4   Insert key tool into hinge lock and 
engage lock nut pattern.

5  Thread the lock into hinge by hand.      

6  Using a ¼” ratchet and key tool, tight-
en the lock to approximately 80-90in.lbs. 
Do not over-tighten. Remove key tool and 
paint protector. Repeat process on other 
doors (one lock per door).

7  Place your key tool, extra hinge nuts 
and this instruction sheet into the pack-
age and close. Store this package in a 
secure location inside the vehicle. It’s also 
a good idea to have a spare key. or on the 
order form contained in the package and 
return it to McGard along with your Door 
Lock Registration Form. A nylon and 
elastic key storage pouch can also be 
ordered.
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Learn more about replacement doors and components we have.

https://www.carid.com/doors.html
https://www.carid.com/mcgard/



